WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
l WARREN, PENNSYLVANIA

REQUEST FOR BID AWARD

For the: December 5, 2005 Board of Education Meeting

Area of Bid: Automotive Tools and Equipment

Budgeted Amount for Area of Bid:
Vendors may request or be invited to bid for goods and services. Bids
recommended for award to individual vendors

- will meet specifications unless noted below,

- will represent the low bid unless noted below, and

- may reflect a bid on only a portion of the goods/services

sought.
AMOUNT OF AMOUNT OF BID

VENDOR LIST BID RECEIVED RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
SATCO Supply $61,966.60
Sear Roebuck and Co. No Bid
AAA Tool and Supply Co. $67,400.49
Strate Welding Supply $66,509.67
APEX Pinnacle No Bid
Warren Autoc Supply $61,173.89
Barnhart Davis $59,500.00 $59,500.00
Snap On Tools $117,369.38
MAC Tools $88,041.83

Total Bid Award $59,500.00



BID SUMMARY
for

DATE: 10/24/2005
AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS & EQUIPMENT
BIDDERS NAME BASE BID ALTERNATE # 1 ALTERNATE# 2 BID BOND
SATCO SUPPLY $61,966.60
Sear Roebuck & CO. No Bid
AAA Tool & Supply Co. [$67,400.49 USA $60,746.68 mixed
Strate Welding $66,509.67
APEX Pinnacle No Bid
Warren Auto Supply $61,173.89
Barnhart Davis $59,500.00 **
Snap On Tools $117,369.38
MAC Tools $88,041.83




WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BOARD OF SCHOOL DIRECTORS
14 HOSPITAL DRIVE, BUILDING 11
NORTH WARREN, PA 16365

CURRENT DATE: September 28, 2005

Submit proposals to:
Mark Rondinelli, Purchasing Agent
(814-723-6903 ext. 2188)

PROPOSAL CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICIATIONS

FOR

AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT

QUOTATION SEALED PROPOSAL XXX

Dikdper 24 #005

DUE: -OCTOBER-17-2005-
TIME: 2:00 p.m.

VENDOR’S NAME & ADDRESS

BARNHART DAVIS

1201 Pennsylvania Ave., Est, 2.0, Box 8§31

Warren, PA 16365

Telephone Number ___72%- 5¢0(

PLEASE READ AND ADHERE TO THE ENTIRE ATTACHED
GENERAL AND SPECIFIC PROPOSAL CONDITIONS THAT
APPLY TO THIS PARTICULAR PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION.

Total dollar amount of entire proposal § (@’O 14210 124110

' 00
Delivery to _ 1 location(s) L(),\ ‘4/56] S0

sgnatare_ W7 B '
Authorized signature W\ A 70 enhie
Piease print name 6“1 QD'\»W\K Condrec b vo gwardafl

Position Pﬁ,é_t&gﬂ ¥ trwe
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WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
14 HOSPITAL DRIVE, BUILDING 11
NORTH WARREN, PA 16365

GENERAL BID REQUIREMENTS

PREPARATION OF BIDS

Al

B.

All bids must be submitted on the accompanying set of forms.

Put your company name on all sheets by some satisfactory means (stamp, label, etc.).
All bids must indicate a firm name and the cover sheet signed by a responsible person.
Time of delivery is part of the bid and must be adhered to unless qualified by the bidder.

Specifications used are intended to be open and non-restrictive. Any reference to brand
name or number shall not be construed as restricting te that manufacturer, but used as a

minirnum standard of quality. Bids on equal items will be considered, but must be
clearly marked.

When no reference or change is made on a proposal, it is understood that the specific
item named on the proposal will be furnished.

If bidding on other than the make, model or brand specified, all technical information,
specifications, manufacturer's name and catalog number of the equal must be clearly
stated on the bid proposal. Any deviation between brand offered and brand specified
must be clearly indicated. A sample of the proposed alternate shall accompany the bid
when requested. A descriptive catalog must accompany the bid.

The total dollar amount of your bid must appear at the bottom of the front cover sheet.

All prices are to hold firm for ninety days from due date of bid unless stated otherwise by
the school district.

I instances where the quantity of an item is decreased by the School District, the unit

price must remain the same uniess the bidder specifically specifies a quantity price
break.

The School District reserves the right to cancel back order items that are over ninety days
oid.

In the event it becomes necessary to revise any part of this request for quotations, an
addendum will be provided to all veadors who received the basic request for quotation.

if you are willing to quote a lower price on condition that you get the entire order or the
order for ali the items upon which you have bid, please indicate so on your bid.



2. SUBMITTAL OF BID

All bids and guotations must have the following marked on the outside envelope:
"Sealed Bid" or "Quotation' along with the subject title and the due date and time.

3. BID SECURITY YES X NOT REQUIRED

A certified check in the amount of 5% or a bid bond in the amount of 10% of your total bid
payable to the Warren County School District is to be submitted with your proposal. Bid
security wiil be forfeited by the successful bidder if he refuses to accept a contract when

tendered. Any payment made to the School District because of default shall be considered
liquidated damages for breach of contract.

4, TAXES

The School District is exempt from all State Sales and Federal Excise taxes.

5. CHARGES AND EXTRAS

All prices are to be firm set prices and are to be F.O.B. destination, including charges for
delivery and placement.

6. RECEIVING HOURS

All shipments to the specified destination shall be made between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 4:00
p.m., Monday through Friday, unless a scheol holiday.

7. AWARD

Al The award of bid shal! be made to the lowest responsible bidder complying with all
requirements of the specifications and bidding materials. However, the specifications
are designed to accommodate various brands and models: therefore, some features may
vary slightly. The variance must not detract from the desired end use. The district has

the final say in whether or not the variance(s) are important enough to disqualify the item
being bid or to choose another product of higher pricing.

B. Unless the bidder specifies otherwise in his bid, the District may accept any item or
group of items of any bid whichever is to the best interest of the School District.

C. CONTRACT: The request for bid, the bidder's response and a purchase order and its
attachments when received by the successful bidder shall constitute (1) 2 binding
contract on the terms set forth therein and (2) the entire contract, and is to be interpreted,

construed and given effect in all respects according to the laws of the Commonwealth of
Pennsylvania.

D. Bidders agree that their bids are subject to acceptance within sixty 60 days after opening,
uniess otherwise stipulated in the bid.

E. The School District may accept or reject any or all bids or parts of bids and may waive

informalities, technicalities and irregularities. The judgment of the Schoel District on
such matter shali be final.

172001
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COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

All property or services furnished must comply with all applicable Federal, State and local iaws,
codes and regulations.

DEFAULT

In the event any property or service furnished by the bidder under a contract or purchase order
should for any reason not conform to the specifications contained herein and to the sample
submitted by the bidder, the School District may reject such property or service. In such event,
the Purchasing Agent or Director of Business Services shall instruct the bidder to remove any
rejected property without expense to the School District and replace it with such property as

conforms to the specifications and samples and/or provide additional or alternative services that
conform to the specifications.

Should the hidder defauit in the performance of the foregoing paragraph, the School District may
procure such property or services from other sources in any manner provided by law and shall
have the absolute right to deduct from any monies due to the bidder or that may thereafter
become due to the bidder, the difference between the contract price and the actual cost of the
property or services to be replaced or substituted.

SAMPILES

Samples when required must be furnished free of expense and must be tagged with bidder's name

and bid identifications. Samples not used or destroyed in testing will be returned to the bidder at
his request and expense.

RIGHTS AND REMEDIFS

The rights and remedies of the School District provided above shall not be exclusive and are in
addition to any other rights and remedies provided by law or under contract.

COMPLIANCE WITH BID REQUIREMENTS

Any inability to comply with the conditions and specifications as outlined must be clearly stated
in vour bid.

BIDDERS EVIDENCE OF RESPONSIBILITY

Bidders may be required to furnish evidence in writing that they maintain permanent places of
business and have adequate equipment, finances and personnel to furnish the items offered
satisfactorily and expeditiously and extend proper warranties for items.

Ail unit prices are to be extended.

Sealed bids received at the office after the hour specified for the opening of bids will not be
considered. The District will not be responsible for mail delays.



BID REQUIREMENTS

1. All tools must be name brand professional quality
tools such as: Napa, Snap-on, Sears, Mac Tools,
Cornwell, etc. You must specify what brand name.

2. All tools except the DVOA meter must have a
lifetime warranty.

3. All price quotes must include a description of how
the tools will be warranty and who the local
distributor will be for the tool replacement.

4. If there is shipping or handling charge for warranty
tools, please state what the charges will be,
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AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT

BARNHART - DAVIS CO.

1261 PA Avenue E.
P0. Box 831
Warren, PA 16365

ltem

Description

QUANTITY

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST
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AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT

BARNHART - DAVIS €O,
1201 PA Avenue E.
PD. Box 831
Warren, PA 16365

item Description QUANTITY | UNIT COST TOTAL COST

1 13/16"X3"X6.63" Standard screw driver DW33 46 .4 15,714
2 |1/4"X4"X8.25" Standard screw driver DW 14 46 {7] 21 bl
3 |5/6"X6"X10.75" Standard screw driver D16 46 5.%4 210,94
4 |3/8"X8"X13.25" Standard screw driver }% 46 1.5 33%.5b
5 |1/4"X1.5"X3.31" Standard screw driver D4 46 .33 EENE
6 |#1X3"X6.6" Phillips screw driver 0P 46 2.2 169, 2%
7 |#2X4"X8.2" Phillips screw driver Doy 46 q.17 196.47.
8 |#2X1.5"X3.31" Phillips screw driver ¢ X 46 24198 JUe. 19
g (P R f £
10
11
“ S T A ¥ - PR
13 18" Short blade scraper 55704 46 555 25550
14 |11.750" Long blade scraper Yg5 46 v.9 2 226-30
15 |8" Cotter pin puller 234710 46 3.9% [80.79
16 7" Pick and Hook too! 1554 46 3.05 14030

TRUE RMS DIGITAL MULTIMETER (VOA) _ PO 6D
17 |SHUTTER PROTECTION  -100-234y, FIWEEY 46 94 H55Y
18 |T-10 1/4” DRIVE TORX NMS 1D 46 [ 45 %970
19 1T-15 1/4" DRIVE TORX WMo 15 46 IRES 5770
20 |T-20 14" DRIVE TORX  NM5 20 46 1495 59.20
21 |T-251/4" DRIVE TORX  NM9 2 46 j.95 %9.70
22 |T-27 1/4" DRIVE TORX MMy *T 46 |5 ¥1.70
23 IT-30 14" DRIVE TORX  NMb%0 46 2o 9.0k
24 |T-40 3/8" DRIVE TORX ~ N$540 46 410 3430
25 |T-453/8" DRIVE TORX N $5 435 46 A0 1120
26 |T-a7 38" DRIVETORX ~ NOT 7] 46 A0 VM -0

5 £027.92




AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT

BARNHART - DAVIS CO,

1201 PA Avenue £,
PO. Box 831

Warren, PA 16365

Item Description QUANTITY | UNIT COST TOTAL COST
27 |T-50 3/8" DRIVE TORX NEHSD 46 290 YORY:
28 |T-55 3/8" DRIVE TORX Nbs 55 46 2.90 | %%, 40
29 IT-60 1/2" DRIVE TORX NT¢ (O 46 4.5 199 .24,
30 |1/8" HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE Nt 46 %4 F-94
31 |5/32" HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE NG 113 46 1.90 %740
32 |3116" HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8” DRIVE NG lolh 46 190 5740
33 |7/32" HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE NG 1] 46 1.90 &7.dO
34 |1/4" HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE  N{»10% 46 105 qul. 30
35 |5/6" HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE /501 46 7205 Gy, 30
a6 |3/8" HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE VA 11D 46 705 94,50
37 |3MM HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE 5% 105 46 90 %740
38 |4MM HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE A0 M 46 j.q90 71.40 .
39 |5MM HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE N 165M 46 1.90 .40
40 |6MM HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE {5 [06M 46 190 471490
41 |7MM HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8" DRIVE N {§79M 46 (.90 %740
4> |smm HEX BIT SOCKET 3/g" orive N 168 M 46 [ .90 140
43 |10MM HEX BIT SOCKET 3/8” DRIVE N 11pM 46 1190 3140
a4 |7.5" BATTERY PLIERS 0% 46 9.95 yJi1.70
45 |4-IN-1 BATTERY POST CLEANER 1113 46 Hes 21390
46 |22 OZ.DEADBLOW HAMMER 5% 46 ih,o15 74750
47 |17" CURVED CAPPED PRY BAR %H 1 % 46 (550 TH2.6@
a8 |62 VOLT CIRCUIT TESTER 1 14 46 541 748 %6
40 |26 BLADE OFFSET FEELER GAUGE SET |7V 46 9 59‘] 257,14
50 |1/4" DRIVE HEAVY DUTY RACHET 5" Lrg%% 46 757% 438.3%
51 'STANDARD SIZE SWIVEL OIL FILTER WR??%)E;L* 46 l/ff;‘f; i‘:) 5. S¢
52 |15/16" CHISEL PUTTY KNIFE UL 46 7.05 qd4.3p
53 |6" SLIP JOINT PLIERS (24 46 (.95 |

519.10

R




BARNHART - BAVIS CO.
1201 PA Avense E.

PO, Box 831
AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT Warren, PA 16365
ltem Description QUANTITY | UNITCOST | TOTAL COST
TG )

54 |7 1/2" LONG-NOSE PLIERS WITH CUTTER(“57 46 (7.4 MENY

55 |7 314" CURVED DIAGONAL CUT PLIERS F 90 46 il-4z 5Us % 2.

s6 |9 1/2° MULTI-PURPOSE PLIERS ¥ DI 48 i0: | H%%.0b

Wéou05

57 |3/8" DRIVE 5/8" SPARK PLUG SOCKET 46 245 1325.70
3/8" PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH L -

55 6" LONG Nis 50 46 474 719.93
7M6" PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH B

59 |67/16" LONG N5 52 46 5.5 557
1/2" PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH .

50 |7" LONG N5 o 46 5.9 155
9/16" PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH - |

61 |719/32" LONG ND 5 5L 46 5.9% 117.7%
5/8" PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH 8 _

52 |9/32" LONG Voo 53 46 G US 29670
11/16" PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION |

63 |WRENGH 9 1/32" LONG NS Lo 46 7435 ERIRK
3/4" PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH 9 L |

64 |13116" LONG Vs 1 46 143 341.77%
7MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH N -

65 |31/2" LONG NDsM v 46 *. 7% 119.%8
8MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH o j

66 |3 3/4" LONG NPo™M UG 46 4.75 119.%%
9MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH - )

67 |41/4" LONG NO5™M U9 46 W, 719 1i9-%%
10MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH ; .

55 |45/8"™ LONG NDos™ 5D 46 419 119.6%
11MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENGH i N

69 15" LONG Npsr 5] 46 529 YD 3
12MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH o |

70 |53/8" LONG NDoM 51 46 5.19 14%.3¢4
13MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH o

71 |53/14" LONG Npst1 5% 46 519 743324
14MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH S ,

72 |63/16" LONG NOsM o 46 (-9 290770
15MM PROFESSIONAL COMBINATION WRENCH - 4

73 161/2" LONG 55 46 GMS Fe70

A

oy

23 X




RARNHART - DAVIS €0,
1201 PA Avenue E.
PO. Box 831
AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT Warron, PA 16365
item Description QUANTITY | UNITCOST | TOTAL COST
1/4" X 5/16" DOUBLE END FLARE NUT WRENCH o P
74 ISET NOF 5U% 46 5.9 2e4.50
3/8" X 7/16" DOUBLE END FLARE NUT ~ o
75 |WRENCH SET NOF 557 46 5.97 bz
12" X 9/16" DOUBLE END FLARE NUT WRENCH | )
76 |SET OF 551 46 %L 290.7 1
5/8" X 11/16" DOUBLE END FLARE NUT |
77 |WRENGH SET NDF 55M 46 7-5C %58. %0
3/4" X 13/16™ DOUBLE END I}bﬁR/E NUT o
76 |WRENGH SET F oo 46 101 473
9 PIECE FOLD-UP ALLEN KEY SET .050" TO A ) B
79 |3ne" S 46 (0% L. 12
7 PIECE FOLD-UP ALLEN KEY SET 1.5MM TO .
50 |6MM 559 46 (o] 5 231-90
g1 |EIGHT PIECE FOLD-UP TORX KEY SET T9 - T40 46 9.95 45770
N 06 o .
82 |1/4" DRIVE 3/16" 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKETS 46 [ 45 (.70
Nrieo? o
83 |1/4" DRIVE 7/32" 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKETS 46 [YS bl 70
NMEO% L .
84 |1/4" DRIVE 1/4" 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKETS 46 ) (op. 70
VM 607 - |
86 11/4" DRIVE 9/32" 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKETS 46 [.95 L 10
NI - |
86 |1/4" DRIVE 5/16” 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKETS 46 1S (- 70
1/4" DRIVE 11/32" 6 POINT STANDARD _ -
57 |SOCKETS NM (i1 46 [4S (lp- 10
88 11/4” DRIVE 3/8" 6 POINT STANDAQ’D%&;&K%T 46 [NS lelp. 70
89 |1/4" DRIVE 7/16" 6 POINT STANIIJ\{;\QD épOlC\&ET 46 /45 Lo, 6
J o
90 |1/4" DRIVE 1/2" 6 POINT STAND’/\AF\(\S SOC‘KET 46 [ ‘7’5 (,,(0.70
91 |1/4" DRIVE 9/16" 6 POINT STANDARIIJGS‘(S’%:(&ET 46 119 105,50
92 |1/4" DRIVE 2" KNURLED EXTENSION +3 46 INY 10719
-3 R
93 |1/4" DRIVE 4" KNURLED EXTENs{gN VO 46 L 4.5
\t\ . ’
94 11/4" DRIVE 6" KNURLED EXTENS!ON W 46 ‘5“4‘4 § §3~?«"§
95 |1/4" DRIVE 10" KNURLED EXTENS%% ik 46 715 519.50

v iy o
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AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT

BARNHART - DAVIS 0

1201 PA Avenue £,
P0. Box 831

Warren, PA 15365

item

Description QUANTITY | UNIT COST TOTAL COST
96 |1/4" DRIVE 14" KNURLED exTeEnsion!0 142 46 (.75 20800
\[! A5 il PR
g7 |1/4" DRIVE 5MM 6 POINT STANDAR@ g’g&'} 46 /-bf) .20
98 |1/4" DRIVE 6MM 6 POINT STAN;:J;Nag 38&2‘% 46 f-5b/ H.%0
99 |1/4" DRIVE TMIM 6 POINT STAND‘R%%%%QET 46 (.55 Ti-3%0
NM oY T -
100 |1/4" DRIVE 8MM 6 POINT STANDARD E‘fO?IKET 46 .55 1. 740
MM bodr - -
101 |1/4" DRIVE SMM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 .55 11,30
j e -y
102 {1/4" DRIVE10MM 6 POINT STANDQ\’F(;‘) (é’o%ggﬂr 46 .55 7130
Ml M — -
103 |1/4" DRIVE11MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 [.55 T1.50
104 |1/4™ DRIVE 12MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 .56 JI-3 0
Me — ~
105 |1/4" DRIVE 13MM 6 POINT STANDARD Sé}éK T 46 .55 T30
]{l i - -
106 [1/4" DRIVE 14MM 6 POINT STANDARD S(%C}!(YE\? 46 2.50C 115.00
107 |3/8” DRIVE 3/8" 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 17 T1.76
NB (g w -
108 _|3/8” DRIVE 7/16” 6 POINT STANDARD 2ty 46 (168 75.90
109 |3/8" DRIVE /2" 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 s 5. 90
110 |3/8" DRIVE9/16” 6 POINT STANDAI%(%&[:%T 46 s 715.90
111 13/8" DRIVE 5/8" 6 POINT STANDAR@SIIégg@T 46 11 ‘::: %5@‘
Gl . -
112 |3/8" DRIVE 11/16" 6 POINT STANDA{gD"goc!RET 46 ] 753/ ?f?bﬁ
113 |3/8” DRIVE 3/4” 6 POINT STANDARéUé%g%E‘:# 46 .15 0 .50
N7 R
114 |3/8" DRIVE 13/16" 6 POINT STANDAR% épozéfﬁﬁr 46 [ %9 9¢9 o
1L .
115 |3/8" DRIVE 3/8" 6 POINT DEEPﬂS,%QKET 46 1.5 W17k
NGO gﬂ;{ o
115 13/8" DRIVE 7/16" 6 POINT DEEP SOCKE 46 1.5 ] 7
; 0
117 318" DRIVE 1/2" 6 POINT DEEP@%QK@TQ 46 1.5b 7. 7
Ve G I -
118 |3/8" DRIVE 9/16" 6 POINT DEEP Sgcb!lé 46 2495 {29.7¢
50 671 .
119 13/8" DRIVE 5/8" 6 POINT DEEPA'S g}%ETO 46 295 12570
NGO (- PR
120 |3/8" DRIVE 11/16" 6 POINTDEEP ég&%&% 46 1495 13570
124 |3/8" DRIVE 3/4" 6 POINT DEEFN g’c?cﬁ%# 46 1.4% (55,70
WD
122 318" DRIVE 13/16" 6 POINT DEgﬁgg&ET 46 240 15690

10




BARNHART - DAVIS £0.

1201 PA Avenue £
PO, Box 831
AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT Warren, PA 16355
ltem Description QUANTITY | UNIT COST TOTAL COST
; -~ . 4o
123 |3/8" DRIVE 3" EXTENSION 20 46 319 144,90
124 |3/8" DRIVE UNIVERSAL Vb0 46 775 35450
125 |3/8" DRIVE RACHET 7 1/2" LONG N 24?3 46 [1.95 SYSI0
%0 V] _
126 |3/8" DRIVE 6MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 [-19 u§.5Y
VBwoI™
127 |38" DRIVE 71am 6 POINT STANDARD SOLEET 46 )49 ts.S
128 |3/8" DRIVE 8MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET | 46 / (5.5Y
Vo e070 : .
129 |3/8" DRIVE 9MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 j. 49 5.5\
NGO M _
130 |3/8" DRIVE 10MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 160 1360
5 61l ,
131 |3/8" DRIVE 11MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 (O 1360
ViDL M
132 |3/8" DRIVE12MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 1.0 12.4:0
133 |3/8" DRIVE 13MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 o 7360
134 |3/8” DRIVE 14MM 6 POINT STANDARD S(gCKET 46 Lo 0 13,60
NG5 ™
135 |3/8" DRIVE 15MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 [0 73,0
B ;
136 {3/8" DRIVE 16MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET 46 [ 50.9¢
3/8" DRIVE 17MM 6 POINT STAW&D SOCKET i
137 |PROFESSIONAL 7 46 1. 7¢ «0 .94
3/8" DRIVE 18MM 6 POINT STANDARD SOCKET |
138 |PROFESSIONAL B@ Glg M 46 A §0.96
3/3" DRIVE 19MM 6 POINT STANDARD SQCKET |
139 |PROFESSIONAL bl 1 46 [ 0.9
140 |C-CLAMP VISE GRIPS 11" PROFESSIONAL HE 46 14,15 55,50
3/8" DRIVE KNURLED EXTENSION 12" _
141 |PROFESSIONAL NG 22 46 X 2077y
3/8" DRIVE 7/8" 6 POINT SOCKET STANDARD P ’
142 |SOCKET PROFESSIONAL Wo7% 46 PR j¥y.90
3/8" DRIVE 15/16" 6 POINT SOCKET STANDARD 4 A
143 |SOCKET PROFESSIONAL Wo30 46 360 eSO
3/8" DRIVE 1" 6 POINT SOCKET STANDARD o
144 |SOCKET PROFESSIONAL L1037 46 2TA NINY2
3/8" DRIVE 6" KNURLED EXTENSION . .
145 |PROFESSIONAL QUALITY IEOWR 46 595 1 77.¢
3/8" DRIVE 7/8" 6 POINTDEEP WELL SOCKET
146 {PROFESSIONAL NBD b33 46 5.5 I { |~q L

i
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AUTOMOTIVE TOOLS AND EQUIPMENT

BARNHART - DAVIS CO.
1201 PA Avenue E.
PO, Box 831
Warren, PA 16365

item

Description QUANTITY | UNITCOST | TOTAL COST

3/8" DRIVE 15/16" 6 POINT DEEP WELL SOCKET
147 |PROFESSIONAL 112350 46 (%5 29210

3/8" DRIVE 1" 6 POINT DEEP WELL SOCKET P S
148 |PROFESSIONAL Wis 46 (-%5 1410

3/8" 11" LONG SPIN-FLEX RACHET
143 |PROFESSIONAL QUALITY bhoi 46 G.4:0 b L0
150 |FLAT TIP CHISEL 5/16" 922 46 139 [0 4%
151 |FLAT TIP CHISEL 3/8" T 46 319 IR 17,
152 |FLAT TIP CHISEL 1/2" Q15 A 46 2.0 15690
153 |FLAT TIP CHISEL 417 46 557 2Y7.02
154 |FLAT TIP GHISEL 5/8" 2.0, 46 Y.29 [17.34
155 |STRAIGHT SHANK PUNGCH 3/32" 45\ 46 2.7 (10650
156 |STRAIGHT SHANK PUNCH 158" {5 46 5,20 1Y1.1L.0
157 |STRAIGHT SHANK PUNCH 3/16° 457 46 5,37 [55.0 2-
158 |STRAIGHT SHANK PUNCH 114" 45 % 46 572 173 %%
159 |TAPERED SHANK PUNCH 3/32" 7010 % 46 T4 11,32
160 |TAPERED SHANK PUNCH 1/8" gL 46 G.HS 1970
161 |TAPERED SHANK PUNCH 316" o\ 46 7.%0 255,50
162 |TAPERED SHANK PUNCH 114»  9¢% 46 10.0¢ Yi:2. 7
163 |CENTER PUNCH 1/4" Tyg 46 2.90 152,40
164 |LOCKING PLIERS STRAIGHT JAW 10" DL 46 g .5 BG40
165 |LOCKING PLIERS CURVED JAW 10" 10w 3 46 5?‘7,{;1 413 10
166 |LOCKING PLIERS CURVED JAW 7" "1l 46 705 27030
167 |LOCKING PLIERS LONG NOSE 6" (LN 46 910 Y213 20
168 |LOCKING PLIERS CURVED JAW 5" W& 46 185 Bl 0
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WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

ADDENDUM

Warren County School District
Automotive Tools and Equipment Bid

October 6, 2005

NOTICE TO BIDDERS:

Automotive Tools and Equipment
Page S of 12

Please change the quantity for the 5-Drawer Heavy Duty Tool Chest 1855

cubic inch (19 4" height x 27 width x 18” depth) the correct quantity
should be 46 each not 21.

Note: Bidders must acknowledge receipt of this addendum by inserting the

correct quantity on the bid form. Failure to do so may subject Bidder for
disqualification.



C 00T 112005 110 34AM WCSD  PURCH / TRANS 814 723 8062 NG 1757 B2

WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

ADDENDUM #2

Warren County School District
Automotive Tools and Equipment Bid

October 11, 2005

NOTICE TO BIDDERS:
Addendum #2

Automotive Tools and Equipment
Page 5 of 12

The item Adapers for foreign and domestic vehicles professional heavy duty
commercial automatic transmission is incorrect the description should read:

PROFESSIONAL ON YEHICLE BRAKE ROTOR LATHE WITH
ALL ADAPTERS FOR FOREIGN AND DOMESTIC VEHICLES.

Note: Bidders must acknowledge receipt of this addendum #2 by inserting
the correct wording for this item on the bid form. Failure to do so may
subject Bidder for disqualification.



c 00T 12,2005 2:14PM WCSD  PURCH / TRANS 814 723 8062 NOATIT B2

ADDENDUM #3

Warren County School District
Automotive Tools and Equipment Bid
October 12, 2005

NOTICE TO BIDDERS:
Addendum # 3
Automotive Tools and Equipment

Cover Page

Notice to extend due date. Due date should read:
DUE: OCTOBER 24, 2005

NOTICE TO BIDDERS:
Addendum # 3
Automotive Tools and Equipment

Page 5 of 12

The item 5-Drawer Heavy Duty Tool Chest should read:
S-Drawer Heavy Duty Tool Chest with cabinet dimensions
19 % height x 27” width x 18” depth

NOTICE TO BIDDERS:
Addendum # 3
Automotive Tools and Equipment

Page 6 of 12

Delete item numbers 9, 10, 11, and 12 these items are duplicates,

NOTE: Bidder must acknowledge receipt of this addendum # 3 by inserting
correct due date on cover page, inserting the correct wording for above-
mentioned item on page 5 and by deleting the above-mentioned items on
page 6 of this bid. Failure to do so may subject Bidder for disqualification.



