WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DIiSTRICT
WARREN, PENNSYLVANIA

REQUEST FOR BID AWARD

For the: December 5, 2005 Board of Education Meeting

Area of Bid: Mechanic Tools

Budgeted Amount for Area of Bid:
Vendors may request or be invited to bid for goods and services. Bids
recommended for award to individual vendors

- will meet specifications unless noted below,

- will represent the low bid unless noted below, and

- may reflect a bid on only a portion of the goods/services

sought.
AMOUNT OF AMOUNT OF BID

VENDOR LIST BID RECEIVED RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
SATCO Supply $4,101.36
Sear Roebuck and Co. No Bid
AAA Tool and Supply Co. $3,945.35 $3,945.35
Strate Welding Supply No Bid
APEX Pinnacte No Bid
Warren Auto Supply $6,449.00
Barnhart Davis $4,495.00
Snap On Tools No Bid
MAC Tools $6,689.23

Total Bid Award $3,945.35



BID SUMMARY
for

MECHANIC TOOLS

DATE:

10/21/2005

BIDDERS NAME BASE BID ALTERNATE # 1 ALTERNATE # 2 BID BOND
SATCO SUPPLY $4,101.36

Sear Roebuck & CO. No Bid

AAA Tool & Supply Co. $3,945.35

Strate Welding No Bid

APEX Pinnacle No Bid

Warren Auto Supply $6,449.00

Barnhart Davis $4,495.00

Snap On Tools No Bid

MAC Tools

$6,689.23




WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
BOARD OF SCHOOL DIRECTORS
14 HOSPITAL DRIVE, BUILDING 11
NORTH WARREN, PA 16365

CURRENT DATE: OCTOBER 7, 2005

Submit proposals to:
Mark Rondinelli, Purchasing Agent
(814-723-6903 ext. 2188)

PROPOSAL CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICIATIONS

FOR

MECHANIC TOOLS
650 piece Master Set

QUOTATION

DUE: OCTOBER 21, 2005
TIME: 2:00 p.m.

VENDOR’S NAME & ADDRESS

SEALED PROPOSAL XXX

AAA TOOL & SUPPLY attn: David Aronson

4632 N. Powerline Road

Pompano, FL 33073

Telephone Number

PLEASE READ AND ADHERE TO THE ENTIRE ATTACHED
GENERAL AND SPECIFIC PROPOSAL CONDITIONS THAT
APPLY TO THIS PARTICULAR PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION.

Total dollar amount of entire proposal § 59‘7’ 2

Delivery to IO@I(S)
Authorized signature j /

Please print name DA’UiD A’fw@ﬂ/g&/‘—)

Position VR AGrE.
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WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
14 HOSPITAL DRIVE, BUILDING 11
NORTH WARREN, PA 16365

GENERAL BID REQUIREMENTS

PREPARATION OF BIDS

Al Al bids must be submitted on the accompanying set of forms,

B. Put vour company name on all sheets by some satisfactory means (stamp, label, ete.).

C. All bids must indicate a firm name and the cover sheet signed by a responsible person.

D. Time of delivery is part of the bid and must be adhered to unless qualified by the bidder.

E. Specifications used are intended to be open and non-restrictive. Any reference to brand
name or number shall not be construed as restricting to that manufacturer, but used as a
minimum standard of quality. Bids on equal items wiil be considered, but must be
clearly marked.

F. When no reference or change is made on a proposal, it is understood that the specific
item named on the proposal will be furnished.

G. If bidding on other than the make, model or brand specified, all technical information,
specifications, manufacturer's name and catalog number of the equal must be clearly
stated on the bid proposal. Any deviation between brand offered and brand specified
must be clearly indicated. A sample of the proposed alternate shall accompany the bid
when requested. A descriptive catalog must accompany the bid.

H. The total dollar amount of your bid must appear at the bottom of the front cover sheet,

L. All prices are to hold firm for ninety days from due date of bid unless stated otherwise by
the school district.

1 In instances where the quantity of an item is decreased by the School District, the unit
price must remain the same uniess the bidder specifically specifies a quantity price
break.

K. The School District reserves the right to cancel back order items that are over ninety days
old.

L. In the event it becomes necessary to revise any part of this request for quetations, an
addendum will be provided to all vendors who received the basic request for quotation.

M.

If yvou are willing to quote a lower price on condition that you get the entire order or the
order for all the items upon which you have bid, please indicate so on your bid.
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SUBMITTAL OF BID

All bids and quotations must have the following marked on the outside envelope:
"Sealed Bid" or "Quotation" along with the subject title and the due date and time.

BID SECURITY YES X NOT REQUIRED

A certified check in the amount of 5% or a bid bond in the amount of 10% of your total bid
payable to the Warren County School District is to be submitted with your proposal., Bid
security will be forfeited by the successful bidder if he refuses to accept a contract when
tendered. Any payment made to the School District because of default shall be considered
liquidated damages for breach of contract.

TAXES
The School District is exempt from all State Sales and Federal Excise taxes.

CHARGES AND EXTRAS

All prices are to be firm set prices and are to be F.O.B. destination, including charges for
delivery and placement.

RECEIVING HOURS

All shipments to the specified destination shall be made between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 4:00
p.m., Monday threugh Friday, unless a school holiday.

AWARD

Al The award of bid shall be made to the lowest responsible bidder complying with all
requirements of the specifications and bidding materials. However, the specifications
are designed to accommodate various brands and models: therefore, some features may
vary slightly. The variance must not detract from the desired end use. The district has
the final say in whether or not the variance(s) are important enough to disqualify the item
being bid or to choose another product of higher pricing,

B. Unless the bidder specifies otherwise in his bid, the District may accept any item or
group of items of any bid whichever is to the best interest of the School District.

C. CONTRACT: The request for bid, the bidder's response and a purchase order and its
attachments when received by the successfu! bidder shall constitute (1) a binding
contract on the terms set forth therein and (2) the entire contract, and is to be interpreted,

construed and given effect in all respects according to the laws of the Commonwealth of
Pennsylvania,

D. Bidders agree that their bids are subject to acceptance within sixty 60 days after opening,
unless otherwise stipulated in the bid.

k. The School District may accept or reject any or all bids or parts of bids and may waive

informalities, technicalities and irregularities, The judgment of the School District on
such matter shall be final,
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COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS

All property or services furnished must comply with all applicable Federal, State and local laws,
codes and regulations.

DEFAULT

In the event any property or service furnished by the bidder under a contract or purchase order
should for any reason not conform to the specifications contained herein and to the sample
submitted by the bidder, the School District may reject such property or service. In such event,
the Purchasing Agent or Director of Business Services shall instruct the bidder to remove any
rejected property without expense to the School District and replace it with such property as

conforms to the specifications and samples and/or provide additional or alternative services that
conform to the specifications.

Should the bidder default in the performance of the foregoing paragraph, the School District may
procure such property or services from other sources in any manner provided by law and shall
have the absolute right to deduct from any monies due to the bidder or that may thereafter
become due to the bidder, the difference between the contract price and the actual cost of the
property or services to be replaced or substituted.

SAMPLES

Samples when required must be furnished free of expense and must be tagged with bidder's name

and bid identifications. Samples not used or destroyed in testing will be returned to the bidder at
his request and expense.

RIGHTS AND REMEDIES

The rights and remedies of the School District provided above shall not be exclusive and are in
addition to any other rights and remedies provided by law or under contract.

COMPLIANCE WITH BID REQUIREMENTS

Any inability to comply with the conditions and specifications as outlined must be clearly stated
in your bid.,

BIDDERS EVIDENCE OF RESPONSIBILITY

Bidders may be required to furnish evidence in writing that they maintain permanent places of
business and have adequate equipment, finances and personnel to furnish the items offered
satisfactorily and expeditiously and extend proper warranties for items.

Al unit prices are to be extended.

Sealed bids received at the office after the hour specified for the opening of bids will not be
considered. The District will not be responsible for mail delays.



PROPOSAL PAGE

(PRICING MUST BE HELD FOR 90 DAYS)

TOTAL
DESCRIPTION NTY. COST
MECHANIC TOOL SET 1 set 294 535

650 piece Master Set .
L : P a

or equivalent (Please specify) CRAFTSmpand b7 23pc SET #9.337 ?/‘;

Bid pricing must include delivery. Top cHes7 # 9-5 7729

LBozsim Cheytr #9-S773

Simicnr. 7o Nesceibrian) o Fases S+
St AT7ACHED SHecs

L. Set should include the following items from pages S and 6.
If your set does not include listed items, please provide a list of
equivalent items with this bid proposal.

2. All tools must be name brand professional quality tools such as: NAPA,
Snap-On, Sears-Craftsman, Mac Tools, Cornwell, etc. You must
specify what brand name.

3. Alltools must have a lifetime warranty.

4. All price quotes must include a description of the tool warranty and
who the local distributor will be for the tool replacement.

5. Ifthere is shipping or handling charges for warranty tools, please state
what the charges are.

Delivery Location: Warren County School District
Central Warehouse

14 Hospital Drive, Building 11
North Warren, PA 16365

e el B
PRINT NAME NSAV D @@Nsm)

PHONE NUMBER SO00-(»13-3993




MECHANIC TOOLS 650 PIECE MASTER SET

ltem #

Description QUANTITY Item # Description QUANTITY
TOP CHEST/ROLLAWAY
WORKSTATION COMBINATION (large
1 enough to hold the following items) 1ea 27 |8" Knurled Extension 1ea
2 114 piece Metric Socket set 6 pt. 1 set 28 |7/8 Deep Socket 6 pt. 1ea
3 {7 piece Metric Hex Driver set 3/8" dr. 1 set 29 |15/16 Deep Socket 6 pt. 1 ea
4 |6 piece Metric Univ Socket set 1 set 30 11" Deep Socket 6 pt. 1 ea
5 117 piece Impaet Set 3/8" dr. 1 set 31 [3/8" Dr. 11" Lg. Spinflex Ratchet 1ea
8 |20 piece Metric Impact skt. Set 6 pt. 1 set 32 |10 piece Extractor Set with Box 1 set
7 ___|7 piece Univ Socket set 6 pt. 1 set 33 |Super Tap and Hex Die Set 1set
8 |7 piece Imp Unv Skt set 6 pt. 1 set 34 129 Piece Drill Set 1 set
9 [HD Tube Cutter 1/8" - 1-1/8" 1 ea 35 141 piece Metric Threading Set 1set
10_ |Terminal Crimperiwire Stripper 1 ea 36 [1/2" - 3/8" Adapter 1ea
11 __iDial Tire Gauge 60 ds 1ea 37 13/8" Air Drill 1ea
12 {1/2 50-250 FTLB Torque Wrench 1 ea 38 _11/2" - 3/8" Impact Adapter 1ea
13 |3/8 20-100 FTLB Torque Wrench 1 ea 39 13/8" Air Ratchet 1ea
14 |24" Flex Handle 1ea 40  |3/8" High Performance Impact 1ea
15 |5" Extension 1 ea 41 11/2" Air Wrench 1ea
16 11" C-Clamp Vise-grip +R 1ea 42 |32 oz. Ball Peen Hammer 1ea
17 |5 piece Vise Grip Set w/kit bag 1 set 43 |7-1/2" WR Grip Battery Plier 1ea
18 |10" Ratchet 1/2" Drive 1ea 44 14-in-1 Battery Post Cleaner 1ea
19 |lmpact Universal 1ea 45 122 oz. Std. Deadblow Compo Hammer 1 ea
20 12" Knurled Extension 1ea 46 |KS2 Combo Wrench Std. 13/16 1ea
21 [Flex Handle 1ea 47 K82 Combo Wrench Std. 7/8 1 ea
22 |1" Extension 1ea 48 |KS2 Combo Wrench Std. 15/16 1 ea
23 _|7/8" Standard Socket 6 pt. 1ea 49 |KS2 Combo Wrench Std. 1" 1ea
24 115/16 Standard Socket 6 pt. 1ea 50 17" Curved Capped Pry Bar Red 1ea
25 |1" Standard Socket 6 pt. 1 ea 51 |8/12v Circuit Tester CC 1 ea
26 6" Knurled Extension 1 ea 52 |Master Offset Gauge 1ea,




MECHANIC TOOLS 650 PIECE MASTER SET

ftem # Description QUANTITY Iem # Description QUANTITY

53 |Double Flaring Tool Set 1 set 81 |5 piece Flare Nut Wrench Set 1set
54 |KS2 Combo Wrench Metric 11mm 1ea 82 |6 piece Metric Flare Nut Wrench Set 1 set
55 K82 Combo Wrench Metric 16mm 1ea 83 |7 piece Comb Flare Nut O/F Wr. Set 1 set
26 K82 Combo Wrench Metric 17mm 1Tea §4 1Fold Up 9 keys .050"-3/16" 1ea
57 |KS8Z Combo Wrench Metric 18mm 1ea 85 IFold Up 7 keys 1.5mm-6mm 1ea
56 |KS2 Combho Wrench Metric 19mm 1ea 86 [Fold up Torx 8 keys T9-T40 1ea
59 |1/4 Dr Universal Joint 1ea 87 113 piece Impact Driver set 1 set
60 12-1/8 x 3-1/2 Inspection Mirror 1ea 88 |3 piece Lady Foot Bar set 1set
81 |Telescopic Flex Power Magnet 1ea 8% 110 piece Socket set 6 pt. 1 set
62 [1/4 Dr. 5" Round Hd. Ratchet 1 ea 9G |8 piece Deep Socket Set 6 pt. 1 set
63 |14 Dr. #25 Torx Driver 1ea 91 |10 piece Deep Metric Socket set 6 pt. 1 set
64 |Swival Filter Wrench-Std. Size 1ea 92 |5 piece Knurled Extension Set 1/4 1 set
65  |#1 x 18" Phillips/c.g. Red 1ea 93 |7 piece L.C. Wr. Set 10-18mm 12 pt. 1 set
66 |#2 x 18" Phillips/c.g. Red 1 ea 94 110 piece Metric Socketf set § pt. 1set
67 |Red Plastic Boot FIAW212-AW224 1ea 95 |7 piece Univ Socket set 6 pt, 1 set
68 |12 piece S/S Punch & Chisel Set 1 set 86 |5 piece Utility Tool set 1set
69 |Replaceable Tip Pliers Set 1 set 87 |H. D. Starter Switch witestlight 1ea
70 |1-516" Chisel Putty Knife 1 ea 98 {11 piece Tamperpre Torx Driver set 1 set
71 |3 piece Plier Set 1 set 99  |Master Bolt Grip set 1 set
72 |4 piece Plier Set 1 set 100 |15 piece Socket Set 6 pt. 1 set
73 15/8 Dbl Univ Spark Plug Socket 1ea 101 {Wheel Lug Socket set wlexten. 1 set
74 113/16 Dbl. Univ Spark Plug Socket 1ea 102 113 piece DP impact socket set 6 pt. 1 set
75 15/8" Spark Plug Socket 1 ea 103 |11 piece DP metric imp. Socketset 6 pt. | 1 set
76 |Combination File Set/CG 1 set 104 |19 piece Mighty Economy set & pt. 1 set
77 |7 plece KS2 Combao Wr. Set Standard 1 set 105 |Hex Head Driver set 1 set
78 |9 piece KS2 Combo Wr. Set Metric 1set 106 114 piece Metric Deep Socket set 1 set
79 |6 piece Bolster Combination Set 1 set 107 |5 piece 3/8 dr. Wobble Extension set 1 set
80  [Screw Extractor Set 1 set
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330 Sockets
37 Drive Tools

142 Wrenchas

29 Screwdrivers

9 Pliers

126 Additiona! Tools

We suggest the 52"
wide 9 drawer tool
chest: 9-59729 Red,
or §-59629 Black. ..
and the 52" wide 14
drawer mobiie ool
cart: 9-59731 Red,
9-59631 Black.

{Soid Separately)




2 | Tool Sets

9:33998 s
673 Pe. Professional

Tool Set »

1/4 Inch Drive Sockels
1t Six-Poini Standard Sockeis

8-42481 3 9-43496 Ay
S-434H e T 943487 W
9-43492 T 9-43488 A
9-43493 Va' 9-4348% w°
9-43404 942" 9-43480 %'
9-43495 ¢

12 Six-Point Metric Sockels

943505 4dmm 9-43507  Owm
§-43601  Smm 9-43508 10mm
943511 5.5mm  9-43509 11mm
9-43502 Bmm 9-43513  12mm
9-43503  Trom 9-43514  13mn
9-43504  Gmm 9-43512 {dmm
10 Six-Point Standard Deep Sockets
9-4357t 318" 9-43578 1Ay
9-43572 74 9-43577 3
9-43573 W' 9-43578  TAs"
43574 Y 9-43589 W’
9-43575 %" 9-43587 ¥4s
11 Six-Point Metric Deep Sockels
9-44401 4w S-44407  10mn
9-44402  Smm §-44408  1lom
$-44403  Hom 944409 12mm
9-44404 Trom 9-44411  13mm
9-44485  8mm 9-44412  1dmm
9-44406 Gmm

10 Twelve-Point Standard Sockets
343608 ¥s 9-43604 My
343600 Tay 0-43605 ¥4
9-43601 W 9-43606 748
9-43602 %4 9-43607 W
9-43602 948" 9-43810 %ig'
18 Twelve-Point Standard Deep Socksls
9-43580 ¥ G-43585 1Ay
3-43501 T4 9-43596 3
8-43592 W 9-43597 “Ag
" 9-43593 ¥ 9-43598 ¥
9-43594 15 9-43599 %48
3 Torx Bit Sockets

942661 T-15 9-42663 T-25
9-42662 T1-20

5 Hex Bit Sockets

942701 348" 9-42704 B
9-42702 A" 9-42705 %
9-42703 W

2 Slotted Bit Sockets

9-42691 030" 9-42692
03eraha

2 Paillips Bit Sockets

9-42681 #1 9-42682 #2

1/4 Inch Drive Tools
9-44807 1/4" QR Ratchet
9-43538 112" Exdension Bar
9-43538 3" Extension Bar
9-43531 & Extension Bar
9-43532 14" Extension Bar
94330 4" Flex Extension
9-4280  Universal Joint
9-4257 38" Adapter
$9-43372 6" Spinner Handle

9-43523 &' Flex Handle
9-4281 15" Speeder Bar
3/8 inch Drive Sockets

13 Six-Point Standard Sockels

9-42998 14 9-43006 1ag
9-43000 944" 9-43007 %
9-43001 W' 9-43008  1¥He
9-43007 5" 9-4313 W
343003 W 9-43020 945"
9-43004 ¥’ 9-43021 1
9-43005 %

17 Six-Point Metric Sockefs

9-43516  Bewm  9-43547  15mm
9-43333 Tmm  9-4357C  16am
9-43536 Bmm  B-43548 1T7am
9-43541 9mm  5-43579  18mm
9-43542 10mm  8-43548  19mm
343543 1lom 943580 20mm
943544 12em  9-43584 Z1mm
2-43545  13wm 9-43B85  22mm
9-43546  tdam :

5 Eighi-Point Standard Sockeis

9-44341 Wy 9-44344  TAg
9-44342 W' 9-44345 &
9-44343 W
13 Twelve-Point Standard Sockets
9-44351  Va' 9-44336 148
9-44328 % 9-44337 Vo
9-44331 W 9-44338  Wag'
9-44332 T4 9-44339 T
9-44333 ¥ 9-44352  5h¢
9-44334 e 9-44353 1
944335 W
15 Twelve-Point Melric Sockets
9-44294  Bmm  9-44305 14w
9-44295  Tmm  9-44306  15mm
9-44208 Bam  §-44311  1Gmm
9-44301  9mm 244307 Vem
944302  10mm 944312 18mm
9-44309  1tem  3-443208 19%mm
9-44303  1Zmm  9-44314 21im
9-44304  13mm

11 Six-Peint $tandard Deep Sockets

9-43333 W 9-43337 W
9-43331  The' 9-43338 g
9-43332 W' §-43333 W
9-43334 W' §-43328 138"
G-43335 W 9-43329 1
§-43236 g

11 Six-Poini Melsriz Deep Sockels

§-44425  Smm  9-44432  15mm
9-44426  10mm  9-44433  16mm
9-44427  1iom  9-44434  17mm
9-44428 1Zmm  9-44435 18mm
9-44429  13mm  9-44436  1Bmm
9-44431  14mm

11 Twelve-Point Standard Deep
Sockets

9-43301 3 9-43317 W
9-43311  TAg 9-43318 "
9-43312 W° 9-43319 "
9-43313 %8 9-43315 1548
9-43314  HF 9-43320 1"
9-43316 14

13 Fwelve-Painl Metric Deep Sockels
9-44413  Oom 344421 1Gam
$-44414  10pm  $-48422 17am
9-44415  1lem  9-44423  18mm

673 Pc. Professional Set

9-44416  12mm  9-44424  19mm
9-44417  13xm 944297 2iom
G9-44418 14m= 844208 2Zmn
G-44419 15mm

4 Spark Plug Sockets

9-43324 ¥ 9-43340 ¥
9-43325 Yy 943330 . 18mm
4 Torx Bit Sogkeis

9-42664 T-30 9-42666 T-45
9-42685 T-40 9-42667 T-50
% Hex Bit Standare Sockels

3-46669 a2 3-46663 ¥
9-46661 8" 9-46664 e
9-46862 a2 9-46665 ¥5

6 Hex Bit Metric Seckets

9-42674 4mm 9-42677  Tom
9-42675 Smm 9-42678 B
9-42676 Bom 9-42679 10mm

3 Siotted Bt Sockels

9-42651 0303 0-42653 0554
9-42652 039"x¥"

4 Phillips Bit Sackets

9-44369 #1 $-44377 #3
G-44371 #2 G-44373 #4
3/8 Inch Drive Tools

9-44808 3/8" QR Ratchet Long
9-44815 3/2" OR Flex Ralchet
9-43537 114" Extension Bar
9-44264 3" Extension Bar
9-44261 €' Extension Bar
9-44262 10" Exiension Bar
0-44263 20" Exiension Bar
9-4435  Universal Joint
9-4266 14" Adapter

9-4268  1/2" Adapler

9-44363 10" Hex Handle
9-44271 16" Speeder Bar
§9-4428 7" Slide Bar

i/Z Inch Drive 3ockels

15 Six-Point Standard Sockets

9-44053 5" 9-44064 7%
9-44054 Ag" 9-44065 944"
9-44055 %' 9-445686 1"
9-44056 %45 9-44067 116"
9-44057 %" 3-44068 18"
G-44058 Vg $-44052 134¢"
9-44059 ' 9-44069 1%
9-44083 1¥4g"

14 Six-Point Metric Sockels
9-44251 Srmm 9-44273 16mm
8-44252 10mm  9-44258 17mm
0-44253 1imm  9-44228 18mm
9-44254 12mm  9-44258 1%mm
9-44255 13mm  9-44274 20mm
9-84255 14mm 9-44278 21mm
9-44257 15mm  9-44265 22mm

& Eight-Point Standard Seckets

3-4422% e -44224 '
9-44222 V2 944225 1A
344223 %16 9-44226 "
4 {rag Link Sockeis -

9-44511 8" 9-44513 194"
9-44512  34° 9-44514 13987
19 Twelve-Point Standard Sockels
9-47500 W' 9-47511  Wag
9-4750% e 9-47512 %"
9-47502 1 9-47513 194"
9-47503 ¥ 9-47514 1"

1Ag°
1
134
1
19

227?1]:‘
23mm
24mr
25w
26m
2?.’:1!7
28mm
29
30mm
320

9-47504 A" 9-47515
9-47505 % 9-47516
9-47506 2" 9-47519
9-47507 Ag” 8-47517
9-47508 " 9-47518
8-47508 249

24 Twelve-Point Meiric Seckels
9-44231 Gy 9-44249
944232 10nm 0-44239
9-44229  1imm 9-44240
8-44233  1Zmm 9-44242
§-44234  13mm 8-44269
944235 1dmm 9-44272
9-44236  15mm 9-44243
9-44266 16mm 5-44276
9-44237 17mm 9-44230
9-44267 18mom 9-44244
9-44238 1%mm 9-44245
9-44268  20mm 9-44248

11 Six-Paint Standard Beep Sockets

3G

7"
g
1

11Ag

g

w
1948
o
1ing"
T

1%mm
20mm
21ma
ZZme
24|Tim
2?7,"—"“

9-47582 W" B-47588
9-47583 %4 9-47589
9-47584 9" 9-4759¢
347585 Ve 3-47592
347586 ¥ 9-47593
9-47587 136"

11 Twelve-Point Standard Deep
Sockels

947521 W 5-47528
9-47522 %y G-47529
9-47523 %" 9-47531
9-47524 Yg" 9-47532
9-47525 ¥4 9-47533
9-47527 '¥Ag"

12 Twelve-Point Melric Deep Sockels
9-44441 13mm 9-44448
8-44444  14mm 344462
9-44442 15mm 9-44447
944443 16men 9-44445
9-44445 17mm 9-44463
9-44459  18mm 9-44449
2 Spark Plug Sockets
9-43327 W 9-44241

1/2 inch Drive Tools
9-44809 1/2" OR Rafchet
9-44816
9-43522
0-44133
9-44134
9-44132
9-44134
9-4259
G-4425
4-44201
9-44202

2" Extension Bar
3" Bxdension Bar
§' Extension Bar
10" Extension Bar
20" Extension Bar
378" Adapter
Universal Joint
15" Flex T Handle
18" Flex T Handle
9-44161 18" Speeder Bar
0-44152 9" Slide Bar
Wrenches

14 Six-Point Standard Cemb.
Wrenches

g-44381 W' 8-44387
§-44382 %6 9-44388
9-44399 tlAy 9-44389
9-44383 %" 9-44390
9-44384 745 9-44351
9-44385 1" 9-44342
9-44366 918" 0-44383

e

172" GR Flex Ratchst




14 Six-Peint Melric Comb. Wrenches
9-42863 Bmm 9-4287¢ 13mm
§-42264 Tmm §-42871 14mm
5-42865 Bmm 9-42872 15mm

442566 Ginin 9-42873 16mm
9-42867 10mm 942874 1Ymm
3.69%68 1imm  9-42875 18mm
947868 12mm 042876 19mm
15 Twe!ve-Pum: Std Comb_ Wrenches

344608 tiag
g-44701 ¥y
G-44762 Vs
944703 W
344704 134E"
05 1
7o

17 Twelve-Point Metric Camb. Wrenches
5-42509 9-42319  1hom
242911 447824 16mm
3-42812 942929 17am
§-42513 9-42925  1fume
9-42814 §-42921 1%mm
§-42815 9-42937  20mm
§-420168 5-42538 Ziaw
B-52917 !Smm G-42922  2Zmm

$-42918  1dmm
15 S*andar[i Gﬁen Frd Wrenches
§-44571 9-44582 W
344572 544591 VAW
9-4457G 944583 ZS4rxiHE
0-24502 Wigndy  0-44584 ¥wiT
3-4458% WA s §-44585 1Hext
11 Mstric Open End Wrenehes
G-34507 Bxbren 9-84508  17x1%um
TxSimm 9-44522 20x2Zmm
il §-44523 21x23am
120 dmem 8-44508  22024mm
G-44507 15%15aw 8-44515  24x26mm
§-44521 1631 8me=
3 Shert Siam}ard Box End Wrenches
94:326 9-44318 5%
5-34317
19 Standard Bex Eﬂn Wrenches
G-43G15 g 8-13925 9arxdbas
9-43926 eIy
9-43927 g He
5-43528
5-43929

9-42951 16x18am
5-42G58 17x1
0-42905 20x2
G 1214w 9-429060 21xZ3mm
3!’.5 il 94?959 22x24mm

?« 8-42837 Y

§-42834 9-426835 W

$-42035 Ny 3-4263% ¥y

B-42p38 1A

7 Meiric Ratcheting Wrenches

9-42840  Bues Q-42644 T

3 e 0-42645  15mmn

12 9-426458 18
13imm

9-44173 ¥ Vg’
§-44172 Yl

4 Metric Fiare Nut Wrenches

944175 Sxlimes  9-44178 151 7mm
942176 1001 2me 5-44178 19:21mn
944177 135

5 Standard Tappetl Wrenches

9-44475 YeulAs"  G-44473 ¥ Vas
9-44471 gt 9-44474 3l
3-44472 Ve

7 Std Ogen End/Sockei End Wrenches

9-42544 W 9-42545 9
9-42541 e’ 3-42547  ViAg
9-42542 ¥ 3-42546 &

9-42543 e
3 Adjustabie Wreaches

544602 & 9-44604 10
9-44803 &

9 Pliers

§-45077 5" Diagonal Cutling

a

9-45378 8% Siip Joint
§-45378 B Slip Joint
G-40385 7" Are Jomt

9-45381 &2 Arc Joint
9-45102 & Long Meadle Nose
9-45087 & Duckbill

G-45085 8 Long Heach
9-450%4 7" Bent Wide Jaw

Screwdrivers
15 Slotted Serewdrivers
9-41589 1'x4 9-41351

941581 ¥gwd 941608 %
9-41584 ek §-41583 W
9-41541 IupxiVe 941579 VigE”
G-41421 Vo2 941389 g
9-41577 He'xd” 941555 Ve
G-41578 Vg 9-41588 ¥5x12"
O0-41587 34"

5 Phillips Screwdrivers

941283 #x2ve  B4118  Faxil
9-415842 FOxily §G-41288 #2x¥
0-41284 #1x3" 9-41297 #3x8”
G-41285 #F2xd" G-41288 #4xg"
6 Torx Sceewtrivers

9-41473 T1-10 9-41476 T-25
3-41474 T-15 9-41479 1-27
9-41475 720 §-41477 T-30
Nuigrivers

7 Standaru Nummers

§-41977 041974
$-41971 8-41975 Ag"
241972 % G-41976 W'

9-41973 VA
7 Metric Nuldrivers

841855 Brm

3-41981 Smen :
9-41982 & 941886 10mn
9-114983 i 9-41937 1han
9-41584 B

7 Standard Cushion Grip Notdrivars
9-42191 g 9-42195 Is°
9-42132 -42198 g
9-42183 3-42197 "
9-42194

7 Metric Cashion Grip Nutdrivers
G-422017 S §-42205 G
9-42202 B 9-422086  10mm
9-42203 7 §-42207  1low
g-42204
Hex Key Sets

9-46696 20-Pc. Siandast Sat

9-46677 20-Pe. Metric Set

9-46701 9-P¢. Folding Standard Set
§-46702 8-Pe. Folding Metric Sei
§-46703 7-Pe. Folding Torx Set
845277 10-Po. Standard T-Handle Set
9-46278 B-Pc. Metric T-Handlg Sat
4 Hammers

9-38292 120z Plastic Tip
9-45787 16 oz, Rubber Mallet
9-38464 12 oz Ball Pein

9-38465 16 oz Ball Peln
Punches and Chisels

4 Pin Punches

9-42881 W’ 9-42884 ¥
9-42882 W' 2-42886 11"
T Prick Punch

4-42841 W

1 Centor Punch

9-42862 I

3 Line Up Punches

9-42901 ¥ g-42503 W
g-42002 Y5

1 Puagh & Chisel Set

9-4301 § Pe. Set

2 Nait Set Punches

3-37552 Yar 4-37553  vig'
4 GCold Chisels

9-42871 V4" 9-42875 W
9-42972 ¥ 9-42978 %
§ Files

9-31284 8" Round Bastard
9-31277 8" Haif Round Bastard
9-31251 10" Haif Round Sastard
9-31205 & lgnition

9-312684 10" Mill

G-31253 4" Extra Slim Taper

Gther Tools
- Hacksaw
—  Pke/s Hacksaw Biades
- Goggles

9-33998: COMPLETE 673 PC. SET
Wi 188 4 ths - 3 Four-Color Cartons




1. Overail Size Cubic Gauge ef Brawers
(W x D xH) Inches Steel Oty W D H Load Cap Weight

52 x 16 % 19%° 12218 Drawer Froms: 24 4 22% 144 2 501bs 1903 1bs
Drawer Shells: 20 2 22% 145 3% S00s
Top/Gover: 20 3 223  14% 4% 50ibs

Back: 20

"Open chest height 3312°

2. Qverali Size  Cubic Gauge of Drawers
{WxDxH} Inches Sleel Gy W 2 H Load Cap Weight

57 %18 x 4114 20052 Drawer Fronts: 24 4 22% 164 2 50ths  245.0 b
Drawer Shelis: 20 4 2236 1618 3% S0lbs
Top 18 29% 1612 435 BOIbs
Back: 20 223 16%  63e  50ibs
993 18V 84 S01bs

PO e O3

3. Overall Size  Eebic Gauge of Drawers
{(WxDxH] Inches Steel iy W D H Load Cap Waight

40Ve x 16 x 20% 0579 Drawer Fronts: 24 1 36% 1436 4% S0ibs 1410708
Drawer Shelis: 20 3 223 14% 2 50 1bs
Top: 20 1 223% 4% 3% DObs
1
1

Back: 20 113 1458 6%  S0Ibs
113 143 5% 50lbs

4. Overall Size  Cubic Gauge of Drawers )
(WxDxH) laches Steel Oy W n H Load Cap Weight

¥ 16ls 4V S0lbs Z75DIns
govs  tele 2 50 Hos
22%  16¥ 3 SUibs
22%% 162 6% 50lbs
13 16%2 2 50 ihs
1% 16l 3z 50lvs
113y 16Ye 123 50Ms

0% x 18 2 41%2  15.902 Drawer fronis: 24
Drawer Sheils: 20

Top: 18

Back: 20
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