

Litigation • Workers' Compensation Law • Business and Tax Law • Labor and Employment Law • Real Estate Law • Estate Planning and Administration • Government and Finance • Bankruptcy and Creditors' Rights Law • Family Law

A Professional Corporation

WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT CURWEN BUILDING 185 HOSPITAL DRIVE NORTH WARREN, PA 16365-4885

ATTENTION: DR. ROBERT TOWSEY, SUPERINTENDENT

AUGUST 11, 2006 MEM 0047551.0132 STATEMENT NO. 140358

436.20

REGARDING: CLIENT: WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DIST.

ADV: OZ GAS, LTD

CURRENT FEES \$3,184.00 CURRENT DISBURSEMENTS 989.05

\$4,173.05 CURRENT INVOICE

OUTSTANDING BALANCE AT TIME OF BILLING

\$4,609.25

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

PLEASE RETURN BLUE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT WITHIN 30 DAYS



Litigation • Workers' Compensation Law • Business and Tax Law • Labor and Employment Law • Real Estate Law • Estate Planning and Administration • Government and Finance • Bankruptcy and Creditors' Rights Law • Family Law

A Professional Corporation

WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT CURWEN BUILDING 185 HOSPITAL DRIVE

NORTH WARREN, PA 16365-4885

ATTENTION: DR. ROBERT TOWSEY, SUPERINTENDENT

AUGUST 11, 2006 MEM 0047551.0132

STATEMENT NO. 140358

REGARDING: CLIENT: WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DIST.

ADV: OZ GAS, LTD

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

ITEMIZED SERVICES

DATE	DESCRIPTION	ATTY	HOURS
07/07/06	LETTER FROM ATTY STEWART RE CONFERENCE WITH DR. TOWSEY AND FOREST AREA SCHOOL DISTRICT REPRESENTATIVES	MEM	0.10
07/08/06	LETTER TO DR. TOWSEY RE STATUS OF CASE	MEM	0.30
07/08/06	PREPARATION OF REPRODUCED RECORD IN SUPREME COURT APPEAL	MEM	1.40
07/08/06	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTY STEWART RE WARREN-FOREST SCHOOL DISTRICT CONFERENCE	MEM	0.10
07/10/06	REVIEW FILE AND GATHER RECORDS FOR REPRODUCED RECORD FOR SUPREME COURT	LH	1.80
07/12/06	BEGIN UPDATING RESEARCH IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFT OF SUPREME COURT BRIEF; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTY STEWART RE MEETING WITH FOREST AREA SCHOOL DISTRICT REPRESENTATIVES; LETTER FROM ATTY STRONG WITH FIRST DRAFT OF FOREST AREA SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPREME COURT BRIEF	MEM	2.50

ARREN CO	UNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT		PAGE 3 STATEMENT NO.	140358
DATE	DESCRIPTION		ATTY	HOURS
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. TOWSEY RE BACKGROUND C PROCEDURAL HISTORY	F APPEAL AND	MEM	0.20
7/13/06	/13/06 REVIEW FOREST SCHOOL DISTRICT SUPREME COURT BRIEF		MEM	0.30
07/13/06 CONTINUED UPDATE OF RESEARCH IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFT OF SUPREME COURT BRIEF		MEM	6.20	
7/13/06	LETTER TO SUPREME COURT WITH APPELLATE BRIEF		MEM	0.30
7/20/06	FIRST ROUND OF REVISIONS TO APPELLATE BRIEF		MEM	4.80
7/21/06	FINAL REVISION OF APPELLATE BRIEF AND PREPARATION FO	OR FILING	MEM	2.30
7/21/06	TRAVEL TO COPIES NOW RE PRODUCTION OF REPRODUCED REC	CORD	LH	0.40
7/24/06	ASSIST RE PRODUCTION OF BRIEF		LH	0.20
7/26/06	REVIEW FOREST AREA SCHOOL DISTRICT APPELLATE BRIEF		MEM	0.30
7/26/06	LETTER FROM MS. JOHNSON RE APPELLATE BRIEF FOR TRIU	MPH TOWNSHIP	MEM	0.10
)7/27/06	REVIEW FOREST AREA SCHOOL DISTRICT PROOF OF FILING A	APPELLATE	MEM	0.10
	TOTAL FOR SERVICES		\$3	3,184.00
	ATTORNEY RECAP			
INIT	ATTORNEY	RATE	HOURS	AMOUNT
MEM LH	MARK E. MIODUSZEWSKI LORA HILEMAN	160.00 60.00	19.00 ; 2.40	3,040.00 144.00
<u>L 1 I</u>	LOVA HILLIMIN	-		3,184.00
	ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS BIL	L		
DATE	DESCRIPTION			AMOUNT
07/12/06	5 ONLINE RESEARCH WESTLAW - RESEARCH			67.89
07/20/06	ONLINE RESEARCH WESTLAW - RESEARCH			48.04

PAGE 4 STATEMENT NO. 140358

WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

ITEMIZED DISBURSEMENTS BILL

DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
07/31/06	OUTSIDE COPY FEE COPIES NOW INV. 56421	408.12
07/10/06	DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION 137 COPIES AT 0.20/EA	27.40
07/12/06	DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION 83 COPIES AT 0.20/EA	16.60
07/20/06	DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION 45 COPIES AT 0.20/EA	9.00
07/21/06	DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION 36 COPIES AT 0.20/EA	7.20
07/24/06	DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION 2,024 COPIES AT 0.20/EA	404.80
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$989.05

PREVIOUS STATEMENTS OUTSTANDING

DATE	STATEMENT NO.	AMOUNT
07/11/06	139497	\$436.20

TOTAL OUTSTANDING

\$436.20