

Warren County School District
Educational Planning Consulting Services
RFI No. WCSD 0405

Master Facilities Plan	Burt Hill Kosar		Crabtree Rohrbaugh & Associates	Thomas & Williamson
	Rittelmann Associates			
Chapter 1	\$ 2,000.00	\$	4,750.00	\$ 7,500.00
Chapter 2	\$ 17,000.00	\$	14,500.00	\$ 8,320.00
Chapter 3	\$ 20,000.00	\$	32,500.00	\$ 42,680.00
Chapter 4	\$ 8,000.00	\$	16,500.00	\$ 43,780.00
Chapter 5	\$ 6,400.00	\$	2,250.00	\$ 10,240.00
Sub Total	\$ 53,400.00	\$	70,500.00	\$ 112,520.00
Educational Specifications for High Schools				
Chapter 1	\$ 5,000.00	\$	4,250.00	\$ 7,180.00
Chapter 2	\$ 2,500.00	\$	6,800.00	\$ 3,320.00
Chapter 3	\$ 5,000.00	\$	4,750.00	\$ 1,700.00
Chapter 4	\$ 1,500.00	\$	1,650.00	\$ 1,360.00
Sub Total	\$ 14,000.00	\$	17,450.00	\$ 13,560.00
Educational Specifications for Middle Schools				
Chapter 1	\$ 4,000.00	No Bid		\$ 6,300.00
Chapter 2	\$ 2,200.00	No Bid		\$ 1,360.00
Chapter 3	\$ 5,000.00	No Bid		\$ 1,220.00
Chapter 4	\$ 1,500.00	No Bid		\$ 1,360.00
Sub Total	\$ 12,700.00			\$ 10,240.00
Educational Specifications for Elementary Schools				
Chapter 1	\$ 2,000.00	\$	2,750.00	\$ 2,620.00
Chapter 2	\$ 1,100.00	\$	4,600.00	\$ 2,140.00
Chapter 3	\$ 1,500.00	\$	3,450.00	\$ 1,220.00
Chapter 4	\$ 1,500.00	\$	1,650.00	\$ 1,040.00
Sub Total	\$ 6,100.00	\$	12,450.00	\$ 7,020.00
Addendum #1	Yes	No	Yes	

Witnesses:

Michael J. Sporeday
Robert J. Sporeday