WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
WARREN, PENNSYLVANIA

BEQUEST FOR BID AWARD

For the: June 12, 2006 Board of Education Meeting
Area of Bid: Paper Products and Miscellaneous Supplies
2006 - 2007 School Year

Budgeted Amount for Area of Bid:
Vendors may request or be invited to bid for goods and services. Bids
recommended for award to individual vendors

- will meet specifications unless noted below,

- will represent the low bid unless noted below, and

- may reflect a bid on only a portion of the goods/services

sought.
AMOUNT OF AMOUNT OF BID

VENDOR LIST BID RECEIVED RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
DeSantis Janitor Supply No Bid
Dobmeier Janitor Supply $24,808.25 $15,797.25
Janitor Supply Co. $19,733.88 $6,641.92
All American Poly $6,630.60
Interboro Packaging Co.. Bid A $7,708.80

Bid B $6,306.40

BidC $4,966.40

Bid D $3,552.40
Val Pro Sanitary Supplies No Bid
Penn State Maintenance No Bid

Total Bid Award $22,439.17



WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
WARREN, PENNSYLVANIA '

REQUEST FOR BID AWARD

For the: June 13, 2005 Board of Education Meeting

Area of Bid:\ Paper Products and Miscellaneous Supplies
2005 - 2006 School Year

g

Budgeted Amount for Area of Bid:

Vendors may request or be invitéd___to bid for goods and services. Bids
recommended for award to individual vendors

- will meet specifications un_!ié'fs‘_s noted below,
- will represent the low b{ic‘f' uniesé“‘npted below, and

- may reflect a bid on only a portion ofme goods/services

sought. / S

,‘\}
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AMOUNT OF AMGUNT OF BID

VENDOR LIST BID RECEIVED RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
DeSantis Janitor Supp!y"f $28,732.40 SQSGM}
Dobmeier Janitor Sufppiy $31,344.62 $7,746.2é\""

Janitor Supply Cg{ $26,924.34 $17,730.30

Val Pro Sanitarijupplies $408.00

Penn State Maintenance No Bid

Total Bid Award $26,426.92



