WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
WARREN, PENNSYLVANIA

REQUEST FOR BID AWARD

For the: June 12, 20068 Board of Education Meeting

Area of Bid: SCHOOL SUPPLIES
2006 - 2007 SCHOOL. YEAR

Budgeted Amount for Area of Bid:

Vendors may request or be invited to bid for goods and services. Bids

recommended for award to individual vendors

- will meet specifications unless noted below,

- will represent the low bid unless noted below, and

- may reflect a bid on only a portion of the goods/services

sought.
AMOUNT OF AMOUNT OF BID

VENDOR LIST BID RECEIVED RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
School Specialty $16,425.99 $145.12
Mt. Lebanon Office Equip. $4,551.90 $725.00
Standard Stationery Supply $12,349.71 $4,104.71
Staples Business Advantage $7,602.87 $1,046.42
Kurtz Brothers $14,724.91 $6,414.07
Sanner Office Supply No Bid

TOTAL BID AWARD . $12,435.32

**NOTE: This bid does not include Copy Paper and Printer Cartridges.



WARREN COUNTY SCHOOQCL DISTRICT
WARREN, PENNSYLVANIA

REQUEST FOR BID AWARD

For the: “\*J_‘;UNE 13, 2005 Board of Education Meeting

Area of Bid: SCHG’QL SUPPLIES (FORM 30/32 SUPPLIES)
2605 - 2006 School Year

Budgeted Amount for Area of Bid:

Vendors may request or be lmnted to bid for goods and services. Bids

recommended for award to mdtv;duai vendors

\-.

- will meet specificatioﬁ\s\uniess noted below,

- will represent the low bid\i}nless rioted below, and

- may reflecta bidononly a pomon of the goods/services

sought. \,\

AMOUNT OF\ N AMOUNT OF BID
VENDOR LIST fBl{) BID RECEIVED ™ RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD
Kurtz Brothers $33,114.17 ‘\“‘\ $18,141.87

7 ™,

Sanner Office Supply Inc. / $14633.25 \\ $2,789.72
Staples Business Advantage $16,916.88 \\\%8,874.17
Mt. Lebanon Office Equipmenf $11,993.26 1"$§_§1 80
XPEDX _;’f ; NO BID ‘fba,i
Milicraft Paper ;‘; NO BID -0—\\
Scfco / NQO BID -0- \\\
School Specialty NO BID -0-
Tele-Sec Computers NO BID -0-
Alvah M. Sauibb Co.. Inc. $1.200.50 $1,200.50

TOTAL BID AWARD

$31,658.06



