

**WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
WARREN, PENNSYLVANIA**

REQUEST FOR BID AWARD

For the: June 12, 2006 Board of Education Meeting

**Area of Bid: SCHOOL SUPPLIES
2006 - 2007 SCHOOL YEAR**

Budgeted Amount for Area of Bid:

Vendors may request or be invited to bid for goods and services. Bids recommended for award to individual vendors

- will meet specifications unless noted below,
- will represent the low bid unless noted below, and
- may reflect a bid on only a portion of the goods/services sought.

<u>VENDOR LIST</u>	<u>AMOUNT OF BID RECEIVED</u>	<u>AMOUNT OF BID RECOMMENDED FOR AWARD</u>
School Specialty	\$16,425.99	\$145.12
Mt. Lebanon Office Equip.	\$4,551.90	\$725.00
Standard Stationery Supply	\$12,349.71	\$4,104.71
Staples Business Advantage	\$7,602.87	\$1,046.42
Kurtz Brothers	\$14,724.91	\$6,414.07
Sanner Office Supply	No Bid	
TOTAL BID AWARD		\$12,435.32

*****NOTE: This bid does not include Copy Paper and Printer Cartridges.**

**WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCHOOL SUPPLIES 2006-2007**

Item	Description	Unit	Qty.	School Specialty	Mt. Lebanon	Standard Stationery	Staples	Kurtz	Sanner
0007	Cards, Ruled, 8" x 5", 100/pkg. Standard weight	Pkg.	48				\$38.88		NO BID
0031	Crayons, Black, Small #836 Round	Dozen	240			\$115.20			NO BID
0033	Crayons, Blue, Small #836 Round	Dozen	200			\$96.00			NO BID
0035	Crayons, Brown, Small #836 Round	Dozen	48			\$23.04			NO BID
0037	Crayons, Green, Small #836 Round	Dozen	48			\$23.04			NO BID
0039	Crayons, Orange, Small #836 Round	Dozen	48			\$23.04			NO BID
0041	Crayons, Red, Small #836 Round	Dozen	240			\$115.20			NO BID
0043	Crayons, Violet, Small #836 Round	Dozen	72			\$34.56			NO BID
0045	Crayons, White, Small #836 Round	Dozen	240			\$115.20			NO BID
0047	Crayons, Yellow, Small #836 Round	Dozen	48			\$23.04			NO BID
0049	Erasers, Noiseless Blackboard, Superior Quality all Wool Keystone or Equal 6" Double Lock Stitched, Noiseless & Dustless	Ea.	60			\$26.04			NO BID
0051	Erasers, Pink Pearl	Ea.	860				\$163.40		NO BID
0063	Glue, White, Pint, Squeeze Bottle, Elmer's Glue All #371	Pint	72	\$112.32					NO BID
0077	Paper, Construction, Black, 12" x 18", Modern #D-81, Kurtz Bros. 100/pack	Pkg.	120					\$271.20	NO BID
0078	Paper, Story, 24" x 36"	Ream	2					\$33.04	NO BID
0080	Easel Pad Tablet 27 x 34 (50 sheets per pad)	Ea.	50			\$233.00			NO BID
0081	Paper, Construction, Bright Green, 12" x 18", Modern #D-43, Kurtz Bros. 100/pack	Pkg.	150					\$313.50	NO BID
0091	Paper, Construction, White, 12" x 18", Modern #D-80, Kurtz Bros. 100/pack	Pkg.	350					\$742.00	NO BID

**WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
SCHOOL SUPPLIES 2006-2007**

Item	Description	Unit	Qty.	School Specialty	Mt. Lebanon	Standard Stationery	Staples	Kurtz	Sanner
0147	Paper, Duplicating, Canary , 8-1/2" x 11" 20#	Ream	100				\$295.00		NO BID
0161	Paper, Notebook, Composition	Ea.	15360					\$2,841.60	NO BID
0163	Paper, Notebook, Shorthand, 6 x 9, 50 pages, Steno Pad	Ea.	96				\$26.88		NO BID
0165	Paper, Notebook Filler Ruled 3/8" size , 8 x 10-1/2" , 16 lb. With standard 3-hole punching marginal ruled, Modern #12/3	Ream	500					\$1,035.00	NO BID
0171	Posterboard, Blank, Green Railroad, 22" x 28" , 4-ply, Finished two sides	Sheet	100			\$18.50			NO BID
0173	Posterboard, Blank, Red Railroad, 22" x 28" , 4-ply, Finished two sides	Sheet	100			\$18.50			NO BID
0175	Posterboard, Blank, White Railroad, 22" x 28" , 4-ply, Finished two sides	Sheet	300			\$48.00			NO BID
0177	Posterboard, Blank, Yellow Railroad, 22" x 28" , 4-ply, Finished two sides	Sheet	200			\$37.00			NO BID
0183	Paper, Typewriter, Practice, White, News 8-1/2" x 11" unruled, Kurtz Bros. #711	Ream	20	\$32.80					NO BID
0193	Paper, Clips, size # 1	Box	60				\$5.40		NO BID
0194	Paper, Clips, Jumbo	Box	400					\$96.00	NO BID
0195	Paste, Art, General Purpose Crayola White	Qrt.	18						NO BID
0197	Pencils, Assorted Colors, 12 per box, round, Mongol #741	Box	500		\$725.00				NO BID
0199	Pencils, No. 2, Dixon Student or Empire Berol or Princes (12 pencils per box) ***SEND A SAMPLE***	Box	1670			\$788.24			NO BID
0203	Pen, Black, Papermate Stick , Medium Point # PA-P333-11 ***SEND A SAMPLE***	Ea.	2004				\$140.28		NO BID

SCHOOL SUPPLIES 2006-2007

[illegible]

WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

SCHOOL SUPPLIES 2006-2007

Item	Description	Unit	Qty.	School Specialty	Mt. Lebanon	Standard Stationery	Staples	Kurtz	Sanner
	FORM 32 SUPPLIES								
0001	Tape, Adding Machine 2-1/4"	Roll	60				\$14.40		NO BID
0012	Tape, Scotch Cellophane, 1/2" X 1296"	Roll	120					\$46.80	NO BID
0013	Envelope, Clasp, 6" x 9" 32 lb. (100/box)	BOX	6					\$22.08	NO BID
0015	Envelope, Clasp, 9" x 12" 32 lb. (100/box)	BOX	25					\$110.25	NO BID
0031	Flag, American, 5' x 8'	Ea.	4			\$95.20			NO BID
0053	Stapler, Bostich B-8RCJ only	Ea.	48				\$312.00		NO BID
0080	Envelopes, White, Official #10 (4-1/8" x 9-1/2") sub. 24, (500 per box)	BOX	100					\$533.00	NO BID

\$145.12 \$725.00 \$4,104.71 \$1,046.42 \$6,414.07 NO BID

Total Low BID \$12,435.32

WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

SCHOOL SUPPLIES 2006-2007

Item	Description	Unit	Qty.	School Specialty	Mt. Lebanon	Standard Stationery	Staples	Kurtz	Sanner
0007	Cards, Ruled, 8" x 5", 100/pkg. Standard weight	Pkg.	48	\$60.48	NO BID	\$45.60	\$38.88	\$38.88	NO BID
0031	Crayons, Black, Small #836 Round	Dozen	240	\$283.20	\$252.00	\$115.20	NO BID	\$259.20	NO BID
0033	Crayons, Blue, Small #836 Round	Dozen	200	\$236.00	\$210.00	\$96.00	NO BID	\$216.00	NO BID
0035	Crayons, Brown, Small #836 Round	Dozen	48	\$56.64	\$50.40	\$23.04	NO BID	\$51.84	NO BID
0037	Crayons, Green, Small #836 Round	Dozen	48	\$56.64	\$50.40	\$23.04	NO BID	\$51.84	NO BID
0039	Crayons, Orange, Small #836 Round	Dozen	48	\$56.64	\$50.40	\$23.04	NO BID	\$51.84	NO BID
0041	Crayons, Red, Small #836 Round	Dozen	240	\$283.20	\$252.00	\$115.20	NO BID	\$259.20	NO BID
0043	Crayons, Violet, Small #836 Round	Dozen	72	\$84.96	\$75.60	\$34.56	NO BID	\$77.76	NO BID
0045	Crayons, White, Small #836 Round	Dozen	240	\$283.20	\$252.00	\$115.20	NO BID	\$259.20	NO BID
0047	Crayons, Yellow, Small #836 Round	Dozen	48	\$56.64	\$50.40	\$23.04	NO BID	\$51.84	NO BID
0049	Erasers, Noiseless Blackboard, Superior Quality all Wool Keystone or Equal 6" Double Lock Stitched, Noiseless & Dustless	Ea.	60	\$42.00	NO BID	\$26.04	\$71.40	\$27.00	NO BID
0051	Erasers, Pink Pearl	Ea.	860	\$3,560.40	NO BID	\$30.10 ^{N/A}	\$163.40	\$185.76	NO BID
0063	Glue, White, Pint, Squeeze Bottle, Elmer's Glue All #371	Pint	72	\$112.32	NO BID	\$118.80	NO BID	\$120.24	NO BID
0077	Paper, Construction, Black, 12" x 18", Modern #D-81, Kurtz Bros. 100/pack	Pkg.	120	\$294.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$271.20	NO BID
0078	Paper, Story, 24" x 36"	Ream	2	\$43.54	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.04	NO BID
0080	Easel Pad Tablet 27 x 34 (50 sheets per pad)	Ea.	50	\$259.50	NO BID	\$233.00	\$326.50	\$248.50	NO BID
0081	Paper, Construction, Bright Green, 12" x 18", Modern #D-43, Kurtz Bros. 100/pack	Pkg.	150	\$367.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$313.50	NO BID
0091	Paper, Construction, White, 12" x 18", Modern #D-80, Kurtz Bros. 100/pack	Pkg.	350	\$906.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$742.00	NO BID

WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

SCHOOL SUPPLIES 2006-2007

Item	Description	Unit	Qty.	School Specialty	Mt. Lebanon	Standard Stationery	Staples	Kurtz	Sanner
0147	Paper, Duplicating, Canary, 8-1/2" x 11" 20#	Ream	100	NO BID	\$395.00	NO BID	\$295.00	\$348.00	NO BID
0161	Paper, Notebook, Composition	Ea.	15360	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,515.84	NO BID	\$2,841.60	NO BID
0163	Paper, Notebook, Shorthand, 6 x 9, 50 pages, Steno Pad	Ea.	96	\$60.48	NO BID	\$53.56	\$26.88	\$54.72	NO BID
0165	Paper, Notebook Filler Ruled 3/8" size, 8 x 10-1/2", 16 lb. With standard 3-hole punching marginal ruled, Modern #12/3	Ream	500	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,165.00	NO BID	\$1,035.00	NO BID
0171	Posterboard, Blank, Green Railroad, 22" x 28", 4-ply, Finished two sides	Sheet	100	\$20.00	NO BID	\$18.50	NO BID	\$20.00	NO BID
0173	Posterboard, Blank, Red Railroad, 22" x 28", 4-ply, Finished two sides	Sheet	100	\$20.00	NO BID	\$18.50	NO BID	\$20.00	NO BID
0175	Posterboard, Blank, White Railroad, 22" x 28", 4-ply, Finished two sides	Sheet	300	\$51.00	NO BID	\$48.00	NO BID	\$48.00	NO BID
0177	Posterboard, Blank, Yellow Railroad, 22" x 28", 4-ply, Finished two sides	Sheet	200	\$40.00	NO BID	\$37.00	NO BID	\$40.00	NO BID
0183	Paper, Typewriter, Practice, White, News 8-1/2" x 11" unruled, Kurtz Bros. #711	Ream	20	\$32.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$37.20	NO BID
0193	Paper, Clips, size # 1	Box	60	\$7.20	\$6.60	\$6.42	\$5.40	\$6.00	NO BID
0194	Paper, Clips, Jumbo	Box	400	\$140.00	\$136.00	\$128.80	\$104.00	\$96.00	NO BID
0195	Paste, Art, General Purpose Crayola White	Qrt.	18	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
0197	Pencils, Assorted Colors, 12 per box, round, Mongol #741	Box	500	\$750.00	\$725.00	\$865.00	\$845.00	\$1,065.00	NO BID
0199	Pencils, No. 2 Dixon Student or Empire Berol or Princes (12 pencils per box) ***SEND A SAMPLE***	Box	1670	\$1,837.00	NO BID	\$788.24	\$851.70	\$951.90	NO BID
0203	Pen, Black, Papermate Stick, Medium Point # PA-P333-11 ***SEND A SAMPLE***	Ea.	2004	\$167.00	\$168.00	\$150.30	\$140.28	\$160.32	NO BID

SCHOOL SUPPLIES 2006-2007

Item	Description	Unit	Qty.	Specialty	Mt. Lebanon	Stationery	Staples	Kurtz	Sanner
0205	Pen, Red , Papermate Stick , Medium Point # PAP-332-11 ***SEND A SAMPLE***	Ea.	350	\$30.00	\$24.50	\$26.25	\$24.50	\$28.80	NO BID
0207	Ruler, Hard Maple, Varnished, Natural Color, 12" long, 7/8" wide, 1/8" thick, scaled 1/16" Metric Scale	Ea.	108	\$10.80	NO BID	\$8.64	\$44.28	\$13.50	NO BID
0208	Rubber Bands , 1 lb. Box, #33	Box	24	\$50.88	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.68	\$38.40	NO BID
0211	Scissors, Right Handed, Pointed, 4-1/2" , Good Quality, ***SEND A SAMPLE***	Ea.	120	\$34.80	NO BID	\$23.76	NO BID	\$32.40	NO BID
0215	Staples, Bostitch, B8	Box	24	\$36.00	NO BID	\$15.60	\$24.24	\$34.56	NO BID
0217	Staples, Standard 1/4" , (500 per box) Chisel Point, Bostitch	Box	48	\$13.92	NO BID	\$15.45	\$20.16	\$12.48	NO BID
0231	Tape, Roll Masking, 3/4", 3M Brand Scotch #40 60 yd.	Roll	1000	\$850.00	NO BID	\$472.00	\$480.00	\$820.00	NO BID
0233	Tape, Scotch, Clear, 1/2" x 500", 3M (NR144) only must include dispenser	Roll	576	\$391.68	NO BID	\$190.08 <i>NHS</i>	\$604.80	\$357.12	NO BID
0235	Thumb Tacks	Box	50	\$6.00	NO BID	\$5.35	\$10.00	\$6.50	NO BID
0247	Vis-A-Vis Pens (Set of 4 colors) Fine Markers, Kurtz Bros. #0824 K-16-4	Set	72	\$193.68	NO BID	\$164.16	\$174.24	\$182.16	NO BID
0291	Pencil Sharpener, ***BOSTON 1031*** (only)	Ea.	200	\$1,474.00	NO BID	\$1,128.00	\$1,354.00	\$1,378.00	NO BID
0295	Dry Erase Marker, Black	Ea.	400	\$332.00	\$224.00	\$113.60	\$224.00	\$132.00	NO BID
0297	Dry Erase Marker, Red	Ea.	400	\$332.00	\$224.00	\$113.60	\$224.00	\$132.00	NO BID
0298	Dry Erase Marker, Blue	Ea.	400	\$332.00	\$224.00	\$113.60	\$224.00	\$132.00	NO BID
0299	Dry Erase Marker, Green	Ea.	400	\$332.00	\$224.00	\$113.60	\$224.00	\$132.00	NO BID

WARREN COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

SCHOOL SUPPLIES 2006-2007

Item	Description	Unit	Qty.	School Specialty	Mt. Lebanon	Standard Stationery	Staples	Kurtz	Sanner
	FORM 32 SUPPLIES								
0001	Tape, Adding Machine 2-1/4"	Roll	60	\$18.60	\$18.00	\$21.60	\$14.40	\$21.60	NO BID
0012	Tape, Scotch Cellophane, 1/2" X 1296"	Roll	120	\$151.20	\$122.40	\$34.56	\$48.00	\$46.80	NO BID
0013	Envelope, Clasp, 6" x 9" 32 lb. (100/box)	BOX	6	\$33.36	\$29.70	NO BID	\$22.38	\$22.08	NO BID
0015	Envelope, Clasp, 9" x 12" 32 lb. (100/box)	BOX	25	\$169.75	\$117.50	NO BID	\$121.75	\$110.25	NO BID
0031	Flag, American, 5' x 8'	Ea.	4	\$186.48	\$220.00	\$95.20	NO BID	\$181.64	NO BID
0053	Stapler, Bostich B-8RCJ only	Ea.	48	\$408.00	No Bid	\$344.64	\$312.00	\$395.04	NO BID
0080	Envelopes, White, Official #10 (4-1/8" x 9-1/2") sub. 24, (500 per box)	BOX	100	\$870.00	\$450.00	\$533.00	\$558.00	\$533.00	NO BID

\$16,425.99
 145.12
 \$4,551.90
 725.20
 \$12,349.71
 \$484.00
 \$43.00
 \$571.14
 \$1,416.16
 \$13.80
 \$76.15
 \$14,953.46
 4/104:71
 1046.42
 6414.07
 12435.32
 12435.32