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ARAMARK CONTRACT RENEWAL - CUSTODIAL 
(WCSD PRINCIPAL RECOMMENDATIONS*) 

 
 

School Principal Renew? Comments from Principals 

AVES Fulgenzi Yes 

“Yes, I like the direct contact with Marty and Mike Roney.  
They have been very accommodating and always work 
with me cooperatively as much as possible.  Just their 
filling in and calling substitutes for the absentees has taken 
a great load of responsibility from me as the building 
administrator.” 

BWMS Weber Yes 

“I have been very happy with the custodial situation here at 
Beaty.  We have very quick response whenever a problem 
arises and have had great support.  The custodians have 
done a nice job.” 

EMHS Martin Yes 

“Yes I would recommend Aramark’s custodial contract be 
renewed. During my three years at Eisenhower the school 
has never been cleaner then right now.  Matt Swanson is an 
excellent custodial supervisor.  He works very hard 
everyday to improve the appearance of the building.  He 
remains visible in the building every day and looks for 
ways to improve the school.  He instantly incorporates any 
suggestions I share with him.  He remains flexible and 
modifies his schedule to meet our needs.  Matt is pleasant, 
and amicable at all times.  He is an excellent role model for 
his employees.  In turn the custodians have never worked 
harder, and been more pleasant than now.” 

LEC Stimmell Yes 

“I would recommend that Aramark’s Custodial contract be 
renewed.  I have worked with Mike Roney with several 
issues at the LEC and these issues have been resolved and 
dealt with in a timely fashion.” 

RES Deppas No answer as of 
4/4/07. No answer as of 4/4/07. 

SAMHS Evers Yes 

“I support the renewal of the custodial contract with 
Aramark.  They have demonstrated both the desire and 
ability to maintain a clean environment in the school.  My 
only recommendation would be to allow custodians to 
complete additional responsibilities such as mowing around 
the building when B&G are unable to stay up on it.” 
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SES Fulgenzi Yes 

“Yes, I like the direct contact with Marty and Mike Roney.  
They have been very accommodating and always work 
with me cooperatively as much as possible.  Just their 
filling in and calling substitutes for the absentees has taken 
a great load of responsibility from me as the building 
administrator.” 

SSELC Buerkle 
Yes 

 (with additional 
building staff) 

“I am not pleased with the cleanliness of my building 
because enough hours have not be allocated to SSELC.  We 
have unique needs due to the age of our students and the 
constant parent traffic.  Aramark tries hard and I would say 
it should be renewed BUT SSELC needs more hours. 
Bathrooms are not cleaned well nor are the desks because 
of a lack of hours.  When we had someone here for an hour 
or two between AM and PM kdg, things were cleaner.” 

SGES Madigan Yes 

“Yes, I would recommend the contract be renewed for the 
2007-2008 school year for the Aramark’s Custodial 
Services. The SGES has been well maintained and cleaned 
through out the school year. I have been very satisfied . . . I 
do feel things would run more smoothly if additional 
training and thought went into the changes before they 
happened. I know the number one complaint from my 
cafeteria and custodial workers is that there is no one 
available to answer their questions immediately.”  

WAEC Nelson Yes 

“Absolutely!  They provide excellent management 
supervision of the WCSD staff.  I have worked with both 
Aramark and prior to Aramark, and our schools are cleaner 
and better maintained under Aramark.  I observe a respect 
for the Aramark custodian by the WCSD custodians.  
Aramark also handles coverage of all absences and 
supervises the employees thus leaving principals time to 
work on things that directly impact students and staff.  Our 
Aramark custodian at WAEC manages the staff and time in 
a superb manner.  Everyone from Aramark is very 
cooperative and knowledgeable . . . I am very pleased with 
the services and performance of Aramark.”   

WAHS Miller No answer as of 
4/4/07. No answer as of 4/4/07. 

WCCC Berry Yes “WCCC votes yes for Aramark custodial services and food 
service.” 
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YEMS Young Yes 
“Yes. Aramark has supported the administration of the 
WCSD and managed and supervised the custodial staff 
through countless difficulties.” 

YHS Jaskolka 
Yes  

(with more 
Principal input) 

“I have no objections to the renewal but the two areas of 
concern is that 1. I have had no input in the evaluations of 
the custodial staff. I was under the impression that they 
would ask for principal feedback. This did not occur during 
the semester evaluations. 2. Principals should have input on 
the change of head custodians in their building. During my 
three years at YHS I have had 4 head custodians and no 
input in why they were changed. I was told by Mr. Rooney 
that Mike Madigan was returned to WAHS because he was 
“fixed” and should return to WAHS. Aramark may have 
the ability to move people but communication should occur 
with the principal.” 

 
 
* All recommendations gathered by email between 03/28/07 and 04/04/07. 


