
REQUEST FOR BID AWARD

For the: March 29th, 2021 Board of Education Meeting

Area of BID: Custoodial Supplies 2021-2022 School Year

Budgeted Amount for Area of BID:
Vendors may request or be invited to bid for goods and services. 

Bids recommended for the award to Individual vendors

-          Will meet  specifications unless noted below

-          Will represent the low bid unless noted below, and

-          May reflect a bid on only a portion of the goods/services sought.

VENDOR LIST

Amount  of BID 

Received

Amount of BID 

Recommended for 

Award

Office Depot No Bid -$                             

All American Poly No Bid -$                             

Janitor Supply 81,444.02$              46,013.94$                 

DeSantis 62.538.25 11,580.30$                 

Bullseye No Bid -$                             

Central Poly Bag Co. 23,897.00$              3,377.00$                   

Dobmeier Janitor Supply 49,086.50$              4,544.90$                   

Cooper Friedman 4,143.66$                -$                             

United Sales USA No Bid -$                             

Jamestown Soap No Bid -$                             

Penn Sate Maintenance 33,792.50$              804.00$                       

Sanford Co. 101,445.39$           438.34$                       

Global Industrial No Bid -$                             

SCJohnson No Bid -$                             

Uline No Bid -$                             

Frontline Supplies No Bid -$                             

Kurtz Bros. No Bid -$                             

Hillyard Inc. No Bid -$                             

Metco No Bid -$                             

-$                             

TOTAL BID AWARD 66,758.48$                 


